City of Wahpeton Minutes

MARCH 20, 2000

Pursuant to due call and notice thereof, a regular meeting of the Wahpeton City Council was duly held at City Hall on the 20TH of March, 2000 beginning at 5:00 p.m.

The following members were present: Mayor Duane M. Schmitz, Councilmembers Charles B. Christensen, Meryl T. Hansey, Dr. Delay Mathiason, James P. Sturdevant. 

The following members were absent:  Councilmembers Richard A. Loberg, Warren D. Meyer, Richard A. Hauck, Tim Schmidt.

Officers present:  Police Chief, Loan Administrator, Attorney, Auditor.  

Mayor Schmitz presided at the meeting.

((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((
Motion by Christensen, seconded by Hansey, to approve the minutes of the regular meeting held March 6, 2000. Motion carried.

The Auditor presented the following documentation of CD investment bids totaling $1,350,000.00:

   Investment
Maturity         American
      Bremer         Comm First
First Comm
Gate City     Norwest Bank      US Bank 

     Amount
   Date
         Fed. Bank
        Bank
    Bank

Cr. Union
Sav Bank         Wahpeton
      Wahpeton
$190,000.00
05/29/00 
5.80%            5.80%
   6.31%

   5.56%

   5.40%
               6.15%
        no bid        
          

    70,000.00         07/28/00
6.00%            5.85%
   6.27%

   5.66%

   no bid

6.15%
        no bid

    30,000.00
08/30/00

6.00%
        5.87%
   6.27%

   5.76%

   no bid

6.19%
        no bid

    60,000.00
09/29/00

6.00%
        5.90%
   6.37%

   6.02%

   no bid

6.27%
        no bid

    50,000.00
10/30/00

6.00%
        5.92%
   6.37%

   6.02%

   no bid

6.33% 
        no bid

  425,000.00
11/29/00

6.20%
        5.93%
   6.47%

   6.02%

   5.75%

6.49%
        no bid

  460,000.00
01/30/01

6.30%
        5.95%
   6.49%

   6.12%

   5.80%

6.59%
        no bid

    30,000.00
02/28/01

6.00%
        5.95%
   6.27%

   6.16%

   no bid

6.55%
        no bid 

    35,000.00
03/30/01

6.00%
        5.95%
   6.27%

   6.22%

   no bid

6.60%
        no bid

Motion by Christensen, seconded by Mathiason, to purchase Certificate of Deposit Investments through the highest bidders. Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Perry Miller and Blake Miller, owners of the apartment building at 104 3rd St. South since 1996, attended and discussed the condition of the 100 Block of 3rd Street South.  Perry Miller said a catch basin was installed and gravel laid down on the street’s east side.  With the City’s help, he said, the apartments received a needed facelift and he had brought up the need for relieving the muddy street condition on more than one occasion.  Mr. Miller said he received word that the condition would be resolved during each of the last two years…but it hasn’t been.

Mayor Schmitz observed that he is aware of the street’s condition and agrees it should be fixed.  Councilmember Sturdevant said it might be a good idea to consider fixing more of 3rd Street. Jim Azure of the Public Works Department reported he had been assigned to look over the situation last fall and it was determined that a special improvement project should be created for a stretch of 3rd St. South, including the 100 Block.  Mr. Azure said a proposal will be put together for presentation to the City Council.

 Councilmember Hansey offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:  

GAMES OF CHANCE RESOLUTION NO. 559
CHAHINKAPA ZOO
The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Sturdevant, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Councilmember Christensen offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:  

GAMES OF CHANCE RESOLUTION NO. 560
TRINITY EPISCOPAL CHURCH
The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Christensen, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

The City Auditor discussed items regarding the June 13, 2000 City Election which is combined with the Preliminary Election.  He said all poll locations and inspectors have been secured and the Council should approve them by motion. Mr. Anderson said the Joint Powers Agreement has been received, is in order, and will be signed by the Mayor following approval.  He noted the Agreement is a part of the combined election procedure and has allowed a 50% cost reduction for both Wahpeton and Richland County.

Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Hansey, to approve the following Poll locations for the June 13, 2000 City Election:

             FIRST WARD:               SOUTHSIDE FIRE HALL-218 5TH Street South

             SECOND WARD:         LAW ENFORCEMENT CENTER-413 3RD Ave. North

             THIRD WARD:             CITY HALL-1900 4TH Street North

             FOURTH WARD:         UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST-1202 Westmore Ave.

Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Motion by Hansey, seconded by Christensen, to appoint the following Inspectors of June 13, 2000 Election:

             FIRST WARD:               LaRAE SWENSON – 103 2nd Ave. North

             SECOND WARD:         WARREN DOBERSTEIN – 728 8th St. North


             THIRD WARD:             JOHN SCHATZ – 514 15th Ave. North

             FOURTH WARD:         BEVERLY McROBERTS – 1418 14th Ave. North

Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Motion by Christensen, seconded by Mathiason, to authorize the Mayor and City Auditor to execute the Joint Powers Agreement with Richland County for combining polls and costs of the June 13, 2000 Election. Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Upon request of the City Auditor, Mayor Schmitz instructed the Public Works Committee to review the administration fee charged Waste Management for preparation and collection of residential solid waste bills.

The City Auditor reported the Planning Commission met earlier in the day with 5 of 8 members present.  He said E.W. Oliver didn’t attend but the Commission did confirm a public hearing for 4:00 p.m. on April 3rd regarding the request for rezoning in the ETZ area.  The Auditor said he has been asked by the Planning Commission to contact Mr. Oliver and obtain additional information regarding the rezoning matter.  He said any documentation received will also be relayed to the City Council.  Auditor Anderson reported a petition containing 29 signatures has already been received protesting the plan to rezone in the ETZ area.  He said the hearings before the Planning Commission and City Council aren’t until April 3rd but he felt it best to put the item on this agenda for the Council’s information.  He said a copy of the petition has also been supplied to Mr. Oliver.

Auditor Anderson said the Planning Commissioners were given a brief summary of the requirement for an Advisory Study Committee and they agreed to serve in that capacity.

The Auditor reported he had attended a meeting of Auditors from larger North Dakota Cities last week in Jamestown.  One of the items talked about was the mandate from the Governmental Accounting Standards Board that financial records must contain valuations and depreciation schedules for all fixed assets. The Auditor said the State Examiners have confirmed the requirement with a recommended implementation date of January 1, 2002.  He said it is probably a good time to begin planning for the changeover which may require a new accounting system.  Mr. Anderson said the City will probably require help in putting together the initial setup and he will be investigating needs and costs.  Nothing need be done now, he said, but the Council should be aware of a possible request in the near future. 

Senior Civil Technician Jim Azure presented maps and a preliminary engineering report for proposed street sealing, reconstruction, and curb & gutter work in Westmore Lawn Addition, Evergreen Addition, and Holbrook & Hobson’s Addition…identified as Special Improvement Project 2-3-00.  He reported the estimated cost is $961,687 and a portion will be paid via the Special Street Maintenance Fund.  The City Attorney presented the usual packet of Resolutions for the project.  He said the public hearing of necessity will be scheduled for May 15th at 5:00 p.m.

Councilmember Sturdevant offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3033

RESOLUTION CREATING STREET IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT 2-3-00

(West Side Area)

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Mathiason, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Councilmember Christensen offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3034

RESOLUTION DIRECTING PREPARATION OF

ENGINEER’S REPORT FOR THE IMPROVEMENT IN

 STREET IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT 2-3-00

(West Side Area)

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Mathiason, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Councilmember Christensen offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3035

RESOLUTION RECEIVING AND APPROVING

ENGINEER’S REPORT FOR THE IMPROVEMENT IN

 STREET IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT 2-3-00

(West Side Area)

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Mathiason, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Councilmember Christensen offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3036

RESOLUTION DIRECTING PREPARATION OF PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS 

AND ESTIMATE OF COST FOR THE IMPROVEMENT IN

 STREET IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT 2-3-00

(West Side Area)

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Mathiason, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Councilmember Mathiason offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3037

RESOLUTION DECLARING NECESSITY OF 

 AN IMPROVEMENT IN STREET IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT 2-3-00

(West Side Area)

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Sturdevant, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

The Loan Administrator reported on a motion adopted during a closed meeting of the Economic Development Commission on March 13, 2000.  Ms. Priebe said the EDC supports expansion of a local industry and recommends reserving $1.2 million of Sales Tax Funds for the industry to compete for location of an expanded facility.  The Loan Administrator pointed out that the motion will only set aside the funds and a motion for actual disbursement would only be voted on by the City Council pending a complete disclosure of the project and financial resources at an open meeting.

Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Mathiason, to reserve from April 1, 2000 through March 31, 2001, a total of $1.2 million of Sales Tax Funds for Wahpeton-Imation to be used in proposed growth initiatives and expansion.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

The Police Chief asked assignment of two items to the Personnel & Public Safety Committee:  1) A discussion of adopting a “Cops & Shop” program which, he added, may require some funding later, and, 2) Discussion concerning a funeral leave question raised by an employee.  Mayor Schmitz turned both items over to the Committee for review and recommendation.

A letter was received from the Wahpeton Mayor’s Committee on Employment of People with Disabilities.  The letter expressed the Committee’s appreciation of the City’s decision to move to a new City Hall containing accommodations to ensure adequate access by disabled persons.  The missive invited the Mayor and Auditor to attend an awards breakfast on March 28th to receive an engraved plaque recognizing the City’s efforts.

The Public Works Director had sent a letter to the Flood Committee containing information of a meeting between property owners south of the City, representatives of the Corps of Engineers, and the members of the City’s Flood Committee.  The notice stated the meeting will be held at City Hall on April 6, 2000, beginning at 7:00 p.m.

 Councilmember Sturdevant reported for the Personnel & Public Safety Committee.  He said the Committee reviewed the violation of Cabaret License regulations by Teddy’s Bar & Supper Club.  He observed that violation led to a $500 fine through municipal court.  Mr. Sturdevant stated the Committee directed a 6-months suspension of the License with all days “stayed” for 12 months.  

Mr. Sturdevant reported the Personnel Committee discussed the request of the Police Chief for expanding the area allowed for residency by less-than-full-time employees.  He said the Committee felt the regulations have to be applied equally to part-time and full-time “non-essential” employees. He said the Committee felt “essential” employee positions have to be identified in order to consider a possible separate residency requirement for the positions determined. The City Attorney reported the residency restrictions were directed through City Ordinance years ago, but, the rules are now contained in the Personnel Policy Manual.  Mr. Sturdevant said the Committee did recommend the allowed residency area for City employees be expanded to include all of Richland County.  However, he said, the Committee will now discuss the matter as a change of the Personnel Policy Manual.

As a City resident, Councilmember Hansey said, he would like to have City employees live within the City limits, but that may not be legal.  He said the Council has to be sure any residency regulations will stand up in court so that the Council doesn’t run into problems later on.  The City Attorney reported he has started research on the residency matter and has found instances where government-required residency has been supported through the courts.  He said a Kentucky restriction, based upon economic reasons, has been upheld by that State’s Supreme Court.  Mayor Schmitz said he was at the Committee meeting and echoed the hopes that it is legal to require residency of City employees to be within the confines of Richland County.

In the absence of the Committee Chairman, Councilmember Sturdevant reported for the Finance & Economic Development Committee.  He said the Committee reviewed the report of Jerry & Sandy Meide’s property tax delinquencies within Tax Increment Financing Districts.  Mr. Sturdevant reported the Committee recommends preparation of a letter to Mr. & Mrs. Meide requiring full payment of 1998’s delinquent amount of $13,827.15 by May 1, 2000.  If not paid by that date, Mr. Sturdevant said, the Committee urges the City Council to instruct the City Attorney to execute the terms of the Confession of Judgement signed last year.  In addition, he said, the Committee recommends taking the steps necessary for a new Confession of Judgement covering 1999 T.I.F. District tax delinquencies which totaled $93,115.75 as of March 1, 2000.

Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Christensen, to approve the Finance & Economic Development Committee’s recommendation of a letter to Jerry & Sandy Meide requiring full payment of 1998’s delinquent T.I.F. District property taxes by May 1, 2000 or the City will execute the terms of the Confession of Judgement; to authorize the City Attorney to take the steps necessary to secure a new Confession of Judgement for delinquent 1999 T.I.F. District property taxes.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Councilmember Sturdevant reported the Finance Committee reviewed the sale history of lots in Schuett Addition and determined a price of $5,000 per acre to be the fair amount.  He said the Loan Administrator has written to President Jeff Jenson of Three Rivers Transport with the information regarding Mr. Jenson’s expression of interest to purchase Lots 7 & 8 in Block 2.  To date, Mr. Sturdevant said, there has been no reply so the matter will be carried over to the next Council meeting.

Mr. Sturdevant reported the Finance Committee met with the City Assessor regarding the Tax Abatement request received from the new owners of Globe Gazette to lower the book value from $272,000 to the purchase price of $130,000.  He said Assessor Stromberg and the Committee determined the sale through the estate would be classified as “stressed” so the purchase price wasn’t a true indication of value; likewise, there weren’t enough comparable sales to come up with a true comparison.  Mr. Sturdevant said the City Assessor had come up with a “blended” square foot rate for the building.  He said the Committee agreed with Ms. Stromberg’s “common sense” approach and recommend the Council agree to $169,100 as an amended value of the property.

Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Christensen, to approve the Finance & Economic Development Committee’s recommendation of a value of $169,1000 for the Globe Gazette property on Dakota Avenue and to forward the Abatement of Taxes recommendation to the Richland County Commission.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Committeemember Sturdevant reported the Finance Committee reviewed the State Law requiring formation of an “Advisory Study Committee.”   He said the Council may either appoint a panel or allow the matter to appear on the City Election Ballot.  Mr. Sturdevant stated the Finance Committee feels at this time that the responsibility of reviewing operations may be completed by the Planning Commission.

Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Hansey, to appoint the Planning Commission as the City of Wahpeton’s “Advisory Study Committee” with the City Auditor to serve as Chairman of the Committee.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Councilmember Christensen reported for the Public Works Committee.  He said the Committee reviewed the list of items to be contained in proposals for sale of the Old City Hall property…including the proposed usage of the building, and agreed to recommend advertising for proposals for purchase.

Motion by Christensen, seconded by Hansey, for the City Council to exercise its Urban Renewal Powers and approve advertising for proposals for purchase and usage of the Old City Hall property; proposals to be submitted by June 1, 2000.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Mr. Christensen reported the Committee also reviewed the proposal for changing public utilities billing statements from a post card to a letter-sized format.  He said the Committee further reviewed the request for, and expanded usage of, a folding & inserting machine.  Mr. Christensen said the Committee determined it is in the best interests of the City to change the format and purchase the equipment.

Motion by Christensen, seconded by Mathiason, to approve the recommendation of the Public Works Committee and change public utilities billing to a letter-sized format; to authorize expenditure of $10,995 from the Water Operating Fund for purchase of a folding/inserting machine.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

Minutes of the Public Works Committee mailed with agendas of this meeting revealed that the Committee had also briefly discussed interest expressed by Richland County as to the City’s feeling about increasing the usage of the City’s bulk gasoline pump for in-town County Departments.  As the Council’s rules require that items for discussion be first brought before the City Council, the Committee had determined the gasoline pump matter has to be entered into the Council’s minutes in order to be discussed legitimately.

Councilmember Christensen and Attorney Lies reported on the proposed Ordinance being discussed by the Public Works Committee.  The City Attorney presented the draft of the 17-page document in process of being completed to deal with installation of services in City rights-of-way.  He observed that previously all approved usage had been granted through franchises but authorized competition is expanding demand for additional installations…there is preliminary investigation for permission to install a fiber optics line now.  Attorney Lies said Cities across North Dakota are—and will be—receiving similar requests from the same companies so like Ordinances are being considered by many North Dakota City governments.  He suggested first reading of an Ordinance be offered.  Mayor Schmitz directed that copies of the document be sent out for further review by the Public Works Committee.

Councilmember Christensen offered first reading of the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NO.  814

AN ORDINANCE ENACTING ARTICLE 14-6

OF THE REVISED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WAHPETON

RELATING TO GRANTING ACCESS TO PUBLIC RIGHTS OF WAY

Councilmember Sturdevant offered second reading of the following Ordinance and moved its adoption:

ORDINANCE NO.  812

AN ORDINANCE SETTING CONDITIONS FOR

NOMINATION FOR ELECTIVE OFFICE TO CITY COUNCIL

(Allowing Statement of Candidacy to be filed in lieu of circulating Nominating Petition) 

The Ordinance was then read in full for second time.  Following second reading, the motion for the adoption of the foregoing Ordinance was duly seconded by Councilmember Mathiason, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following Councilmembers voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Ordinance was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor and attested to the City Auditor.

The Council then continued discussing the matter of establishing a new on-sale liquor license to allow for alcohol sales from a beverage cart on the entire premises of a full-sized golf course.  The City Attorney noted the new C-6 classification will be created by Ordinance and the $806.00 annual fee will be set by Resolution.  Auditor Anderson said the golf course was granted a C-5 liquor license for 2000 (at an $806.00 fee) and a motion will also be needed to grant a replacement license after the Ordinance and Resolutions are adopted.

Councilmember Christensen offered second reading of the following Ordinance and moved its adoption:

ORDINANCE NO.  813

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 22-206

LIQUOR LICENSE CLASSIFICATIONS

(Adding Class C-6 Golf Course)

The Ordinance was then read in full for second time.  Following second reading, the motion for the adoption of the foregoing Ordinance was duly seconded by Councilmember Sturdevant, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following Councilmembers voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Ordinance was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor and attested to the City Auditor.

Councilmember Christensen offered the following Resolution and moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 3038

RESOLUTION ESTABLISHING LIQUOR LICENSE FEE

CLASS C(6) – GOLF COURSE LIQUOR LICENSE

The motion for the adoption of the foregoing Resolution was duly seconded by Councilmember Sturdevant, and upon vote being taken thereon, the following voted in favor thereof:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; and the following voted against the same:  None.  Whereupon said Resolution was declared duly passed and adopted, was signed by the Mayor, and attested to by the City Auditor.

Motion by Hansey, seconded by Christensen, to approve transfer of the Bois de Sioux Golf Course Liquor License No. 2013 from Class C-5 to Class C-6 at no additional fee.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye:  Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

The City Attorney reported a request has been made to increase the number of appointed Board of Adjustment members from five to seven.  He explained that State Law requires 4 positive votes in order to approve some actions before the Board and the “super majority” requirement becomes cumbersome when less than all five members attend meetings.  Attorney Lies said the City’s Home Rule power permits the City Council to adopt an Ordinance allowing additional appointees to the Board of Adjustment while keeping the “4 positive votes” provision in place.  A copy of the proposed Ordinance was reviewed.

Councilmember Sturdevant offered first reading of the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NO. 815

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 16-5

ZONING ORDINANCES – ADMINISTRATION

(Increases Board of Adjustment to 7 Members)

Questions were asked about the rezoning sequence in the Extra Territorial Zoning Area.  It was pointed out that first reading for rezoning could be offered to avoid delaying new usage if the rezoning is deemed proper following public hearings before the Planning Commission and City Council.  The actual rezoning could not be accomplished until completion of the public hearings on April 3rd and subsequent second reading & passage of the Ordinance.

Councilmember Sturdevant offered first reading of the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NO. 816

AN ORDINANCE REZONING ETZ PROPERTY

FROM B-3 TO ETZ-1

(Part of SW¼NE¼ and SE¼NW¼ of Section 7, Township 132N, Range 47)

Motion by Loberg, seconded by Hansey, to approve the following reports:  FEB Wahpeton Water Works; FEB Police Department.  Motion carried 4-0.  Voting aye: Christensen, Hansey, Mathiason, Sturdevant; voting nay:  None.

The following Committee meetings were scheduled:






* FINANCE & ECON DEV
Pending





* PUBLIC WORKS
       
Pending

* PERS & PUBL SAFETY 
Pending





* FLOOD MITIGATION
Noon               3/27/2000














Motion by Sturdevant, seconded by Hansey, to adjourn.  Motion carried.









      _____________________________________________

ATTEST:








    Duane M. Schmitz, Mayor

__________________________________________


Arden C. Anderson, City Auditor  







